British Board of Film Classification
(Accountability to Parliament and Appeals) Bill

EXPLANATORY NOTES

Explanatory notes to the Bill, prepared by Mr Julian Brazier, are published separately
as Bill 16 —EN.

Bill 16 54/3



British Board of Film Classification

(Accountability to Parliament and Appeals) Bill

N

N U1~ W

Bill 16

CONTENTS

Parliamentary scrutiny of appointments to the British Board of Film
Classification

Establishment of a body to hear appeals and reviews of decisions of the
British Board of Film Classification

Parliamentary scrutiny of BBFC guidelines

Increase in penalties for offences

Interpretation

Commencement

54/3



British Board of Film Classification (Accountability to Parliament and Appeals) Bill 1

BILL

Make provision for parliamentary scrutiny of senior appointments to the
British Board of Film Classification and of guidelines produced by it; to
establish a body with powers to hear appeals against the release of videos and
DVDs and the classification of works in prescribed circumstances; to make
provision about penalties for the distribution of illegal works; and for
connected purposes.

E IT ENACTED by the Queen’s most Excellent Majesty, by and with the advice and
consent of the Lords Spiritual and Temporal, and Commons, in this present
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows: —

1 Parliamentary scrutiny of appointments to the British Board of Film
Classification

(1) Section 4 of the Video Recordings Act 1984 (c.39) (authority to determine
suitability of video works for classification) (“the 1984 Act”) is amended as
follows.

(2) After subsection (2) insert—

“(2A) Where a vacancy exists in any of the principal offices of the designated
authority, the designated authority must provide to the Home Affairs
Committee of the House of Commons (“the Committee”) a list
containing the names of at least 3 persons whom the designated
authority considers qualified to fill the vacancy.

(2B) The Secretary of State must, by order made by statutory instrument,
specify the offices to which subsection (2A) applies.

(2C) The Secretary of State must not confirm the appointment of a person
included in the list mentioned in subsection (2A) in respect of whom
the Committee has signified its view that he or she is not an appropriate
person to fill the relevant vacancy.

(2D) Where the procedure described in subsections (2A) and (2C) applies, it
is to be followed before the commencement of the parliamentary
procedure for designation under section 5 of this Act.”

Bill 16 54/3

10

15

20



2 British Board of Film Classification (Accountability to Parliament and Appeals) Bill
(3) Insubsection (4) after “section” insert *, subject to subsection (2A),”.
2 Establishment of a body to hear appeals and reviews of decisions of the

(1)
@)

British Board of Film Classification

The 1984 Act is further amended as follows.

After section 4 insert—

“47ZA Establishment of a body to hear appeals or reviews

(1)

(2)

®)

(10)

47B

1)

The designated authority must establish a body (“the appeals body”) to
hear all appeals or reviews of the authority’s decisions on classification
and other matters related to video works.

The appeals body is to be composed of a panel of independent persons
from whom a jury of 12 must be selected at random for each hearing of
an appeal or review.

A member of the appeals body must not take part in a hearing if at any
time he or she has a conflict of interest that could conflict with the
proper performance of a member’s functions in relation to the matter of
the appeal or review.

A member of the appeals body may not serve in that capacity for longer
than 5 years.

A member of the appeals body must be provided by the designated
authority with reasonable expenses for such jury attendance, but with
no other payment.

The designated authority must appoint one member of each jury to act
as chairman.

The decision on the suitability of a video work in terms of whether or
not it shall be issued with a classification certificate, or with a different
classification certificate, is to be decided by majority vote of the jury,
and where the votes are equal the chairman shall have the casting vote.

In making a decision on the suitability of a video work, the chairman
and the jury must have special regard to public concerns about violence
and the sexualisation of children.

The results of all appeals and reviews must be published in the
designated authority's annual report.

In this section “independent”, in relation to a member of the appeals
body, means having no financial or other personal interest in the video
or film industry.

Hearing at any stage by appeals body of reviews as a result of early day
motion

If, during any stage of the process of classification of a video work by
the designated authority, not fewer than 50 Members of the House of
Commons give notice of a motion calling for a review of a relevant
decision by the authority, the decision in question shall stand referred
to the appeals body, which must consider it in accordance with the
procedure set out in section 4ZA.

10

15

20

25

30

35

40



British Board of Film Classification (Accountability to Parliament and Appeals) Bill 3

(2) In this section “relevant decision” means a decision by the designated
authority concerning the classification of a video or about the handling
of such a matter.

47ZC Review of determinations as to suitability of existing classified video
works as a result of early day motion

(1) The Secretary of State may by order provide that, where not fewer than
50 Members of the House of Commons give notice of a motion calling
for a review by the appeals body of the suitability of an existing video
work, the video specified in the notice of motion shall stand referred to
the appeals body, which must conduct a review in accordance with the
procedure set out in section 4ZA.

(2) An order under subsection (1) must provide for the sale, supply and
distribution of a video work which is the subject of a review under
subsection (1) to be suspended pending the consideration of the review
by the appeals body if the Secretary of State considers it likely that such
a video work may not be considered suitable for a classification
certificate.

(3) The power to make an order under this section is exercisable by
statutory instrument which shall be subject to annulment in pursuance
of a resolution of either House of Parliament.”

3 Parliamentary scrutiny of BBFC guidelines
(1) The 1984 Act is further amended as follows.
(2) After section 4ZC (inserted by section 2 of this Act) insert—
“47ZD Parliamentary scrutiny of BBFC guidelines

(1) Once in every Parliament, and prior to any proposed revision by the
designated authority of its guidelines, the authority must submit a draft
of the guidelines (or, as the case may be, revised guidelines) to the
Committee.

(2) The designated authority must not treat the guidelines or the revised
guidelines as being in force unless the Committee has signified its
approval of them.

(3) In this section “guidelines” means the guidelines used by the
designated authority in determining the suitability of a video work.”

4 Increase in penalties for offences
(1) The 1984 act is further amended as follows.

2) In section 9(3) (supplying video recording of unclassified work) —
pplying &
(@) inparagraph (a) for “2 years” substitute “7 years”, and
(b) in paragraph (b) for “6 months” substitute “12 months”.

(3) In section 10(3) (possession of video recording of unclassified work for the
purposes of supply) —

(@) inparagraph (a) for “2 years” substitute 7 years” and
(b) in paragraph (b) for “6 months” substitute “12 months”.

10

15

20

25

30

35

40



British Board of Film Classification (Accountability to Parliament and Appeals) Bill

(1)
(2)

(1)

)

In section 11(3) (supplying video recording of classified work in breach of
classification), for “6 months” substitute “12 months” and for “level 5 on the
standard scale” substitute “£20,000”.

In section 12(4A) (certain video recordings only to be supplied in licensed sex
shops), for “6 months” substitute “12 months” and for “level 5 on the standard
scale” substitute “£20,000”.

In section 13(3) (supply of video recording not complying with requirements
as to labels, etc), for “level 5 on the standard scale” substitute “£10,000”.

In section 14(5) (supply of video recording containing false indication as to
classification), for “6 months” substitute “12 months” and for “level 5 on the
standard scale” substitute “£20,000”.

Interpretation
The 1984 Act is further amended as follows.

In section 22(1) (other interpretation) at the appropriate place insert—
““Home Affairs Committee” means any committee of the House of
Commons appointed under that name or any committee appointed
under a different name with substantially the same functions;”;
suitability” means suitability for the issue of a classification certificate or
suitability for the issue of a certificate of a particular description;”.

113113

Commencement

The preceding provisions of this Act shall come into force in accordance with
provision made by order by the Secretary of State.

An order under subsection (1) —

(@) shall be made by statutory instrument and shall be subject to
annulment in pursuance of a resolution by either House of Parliament;
and

(b) may include such transitional or consequential provisions to amend or
repeal Acts or statutory instruments as the Secretary of State considers
necessary or expedient.

10

15

20

25



British Board of Film Classification
(Accountability to Parliament and Appeals) Bill

BILL

To make provision for parliamentary scrutiny of senior appointments to the
British Board of Film Classification and of guidelines produced by it; to
establish a body with powers to hear appeals against the release of videos and
DVDs and the classification of works in prescribed circumstances; to make
provision about penalties for the distribution of illegal works; and for
connected purposes.

Presented by Mr Julian Brazier
supported by
Mr John Gummer, Keith Vaz,
Miss Ann Widdecombe, Mr Jim Hood,
Stephen Pound, Mr John Hayes,
Mpr Lindsay Hoyle, Mrs Nadine Dorries,
Jim Dobbin, Mr David Burrowes
and Mr Greg Hands.

Ordered, by The House of Commons,
to be Printed, 5th December 2007.

© Parliamentary copyright House of Commons 2008
Applications for reproduction should be made in writing to the Copyright Unit,
Her Majesty s Stationery Office, St. Clements House, 2-16 Colegate, Norwich, NR3 1BQ

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY OF THE HOUSE OF COMMONS
LONDON — THE STATIONERY OFFICE LIMITED
Printed in the United Kingdom by
The Stationery Office Limited
£X.XX

BIH 16 (XxXXXX) 54/3

xxxbarxxx




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJDFFile false
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /CMYK
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /Description <<
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065876863900275284e8e9ad88d2891cf76845370524d53705237300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef69069752865bc9ad854c18cea76845370524d5370523786557406300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <FEFF9ad854c18cea306a30d730ea30d730ec30b951fa529b7528002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020658766f8306e4f5c6210306b4f7f75283057307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a30674f5c62103055308c305f0020005000440046002030d530a130a430eb306f3001004100630072006f0062006100740020304a30883073002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee5964d3067958b304f30533068304c3067304d307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a306b306f30d530a930f330c8306e57cb30818fbc307f304c5fc59808306730593002>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020ace0d488c9c80020c2dcd5d80020c778c1c4c5d00020ac00c7a50020c801d569d55c002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die zijn geoptimaliseerd voor prepress-afdrukken van hoge kwaliteit. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /PTB <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents best suited for high-quality prepress printing.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


